
tlxp 50 fr qF:a-(`q])047000772003-18

rl
REGISTERED  NO.  DL- 04/0007/2003-18

¢fari®¢he ®®g€tlle
3rHTrm

EXTRAOREINARY
rm II-as I

PART 11 - Section 1
Tiiin a wrfu

PUBLISHED  BY AUTHORITY

rio io]                      *fca, th, ed 27, 2018;qiq 7, 1939 (¥iar)
No.10]      REWDELHI, SATURDAY, JANUARY 27, 2018"AGHA 7,1939 (SAKA)

qqamT¥ifeTgwhawh%faefsqgerentiffli%svti{aiffldsi
Separate paging is given to this Part in order that it may be filed as a separate compilation.

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE
(Legisla tive Dep artm ent)

Ne:w Delhi, the 27th January, 2.0\81 Magha 7 , \939  (Saka)

The  following Act  of   Parliament  received  the  assent  of the President  on  the
25th January, 2018, and is hereby published for general information:-

THE HIGH COURT AND SUPREME COURT JUDGES
(SALARIES AND CONDITIONS OF SERVICE)

AMENDMENT ACT, 201 8

No.10 oF 2018
[25zfe /o#"any, 2018.]

AnActfurthertoanendtheHighcourtJudges(Salariesandconditionsof
Service)Act,1954andthesupremecourtJudges(Salariesand

Conditions of service) Act, 195 8.

BEitenactedbyParliamentintheSixty€ighthYearoftheRepublicoflndiaasfollows:-

CHAPTER I

PRELIMINARY

i. (J)ThisActmaybe called the High courtand supreme courtJudges (Salaries and    Short title and
Conditions of service) AmendmentAct, 2018.                                                                                           commencement.

(2) Sections 2, 5, 6 and 9 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1 st day of
January, 2016.  Sections 3 and 7 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 1 st day of
July, 2017.  Sections 4 and 8 shall be deemed to have come into force on the 22nd day of
September,2017.



2                                  THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY                   PART II-

Amendment
of section
13A.

Amendment
of section
2:2.AL.

Amendment
of section
22C.

Amendment
of First
Schedule.

Amendment
of section
12A.

CHAPTER 11

AMENDMENTS  0F  THE  HIGH  COURT  JUDGES  (SALARIES  AND

CONDITIONS  0F  SERVICE) ACT,1954

2. In the High court Judges (Salaries and conditions of service) Act,1954 thereinafter    28  of 1954.
referred to as the High Court Judges Act), in section 13A,-

(cz) in sub-section (/), for the words "ninety thousand rupees per mensem", the
words "two lalch fifty thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted;

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "eighty thousand rupees per mensem", the
words "two lakh twenty-five thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted.

3. In secti'on 22A of the High Court Judges Act, for  sub-section (2), the following
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(2) Where a Judge does not avail himself of the use of an official residence, he

may be paid every month an allowance equivalent to an amount of twenty-four per
centum of the salary which shall be increased at the rate of-

(a) twentyLseven per centum, when Dearness Allowance crosses twenty-
five per centum; and

(a) thirty per centum, when Dearness Allowance crosses fifty per centum.

4. In the High Court Judges Act, in section 22C, for the words "fifteen thousand" and
"twelve thousand", the words "thirty-four thousand" and "twenty-seven thousand" shall

respectively be substituted.

5. In the First Schedule to the High Court Judges Act,-

(cz) in Part I, in paragraph 2,-

(,4) in clause (a), for the letters and figures "Rs. 43,890", the letters and
figures "Rs.1,21,575" shall be substituted;

(8) in clause (a), for the letters and figures "Rs. 34,350", the letters and
figures "Rs. 96,524" shall be substituted;

(C)  in  the  proviso,  for  the  letters  and  figures  "Rs..5,40,000"  and
"Rs. 4,80,000", the letters and figures "Rs. 15,00,000" and "Rs.  13,50,000" shall

respectively  be  substituted;

(b) In Part Ill, in paragraph 2,-

(4) in clause (a), for the letters and figures "Rs.16,020", the letters and
figures "Rs. 45,016" shall be substituted;

(8) in the proviso, for the letters and figures "Rs. 5,40,000" and "Rs. 4,80,000",
the letters and figures "Rs. 15,00,000" and "Rs.  13,50,000" shall respectively be
substituted.

CHAPTER Ill

AMENDMENTS  OF  THE  SUPREME  COURT  JUDGES  (SALARIES  AND  CONDITIONS  OF  SERVICE)

ACT,1958

6.  In  the  Supreme  Court  Judges  (Salaries  and  Conditions  of Service)  Act,  1958    41  of 1958.

(hereinafter referred to as the Supreme Court Judges Act), in section 12A,-

(cz) in sub-section (/), for the words "one lakh rupees per mensem", the words
"two lakh eighty thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted;



SEc.1]                          THE GAZETTE OF INDIA EXTRAORDINARY                                   3

(b) in sub-section (2), for the words "ninety thousand rupees per mensem", the
words "two lakh fifty thousand rupees per mensem" shall be substituted.

7. In section 23 of the Supreme Court Judges Act, for sub-section (/,4), the following    Amendment
sub-section shall be substituted, namely:-

"(/4)wiereaJudgedoesnotavailhimselfoftheuseofanofficialresidence,he

may be paid every month an allowance equivalent to an amount of twenty-four per
centum of the salary which shall be increased at the rate of-

(cz)  twenty-seven  per  centum,  when  Dearness  Allowance  crosses
twenty-five per centum; and

(b)thirtypercentum,whenDeamessAllowancecrossesfiftypercentum.".

8. In section 238 of the Supreme Court Judges Act, for the words "twenty thousand"
and "fifteen thousand", the words "forty-five thousand" and "thirty-four thousand" shall
respectively be substituted.

9. In the Schedule to the Supreme Court Judges Act,-

(a) in Part I,-

(z.) in paragraph 2-

(A) in clause (6), for the letters and figures "Rs.12,180", "Rs. 3,69,300",
and "Rs.  31,030",  the letters and figures  "Rs.  34,104",  "Rs.10,34,040",   and
"Rs. 86,884" shall respectively be substituted;

(8) in the proviso, for the letters and figures "Rs. 6,00,000", the letters and
figures "Rs.  16,80,000" shall be substituted;

(!.!.) in paragraph 3, in the proviso, for the letters and figures "Rs. 5,40,000",
the letters and figures "Rs.15,00,000" shall be substituted;

(b) in Part Ill, in paragraph 2,-

(4) in clause (A), for the letters and figures "Rs.16,020", the letters and
figures "Rs. 45,016" shall be substituted;

(8)  in  the  proviso,  for  the  letters  and  figures  "Rs.  6,00,000"  and
"Rs. 5,40,000", the letters and figures "Rs. 16,80,000" and "Rs. 15,00,000" shall

respectively be  substituted.

DR . G. NARAYANA RAJU,
Secretary to the Govt. Of  India.

of section  23.

Amendment
of section
238.

Amendment
of the
Schedule.

UPLOADED  BY  THE  GENERAL  MANAGER,  GOVERNMENT  OF  INDIA  PRESS,  MINTO  ROAD,    NEW  DELHI-I 10002
AND  PUBLISHED  BY THE  CONTROLLER  OF    PUBLICATIONS,  DELHI-110054.

GMGIPMRND-3792Gl(S3)-27-01-2018.


